
Mental Health Transport

Q1. Current Supplier Information

Do you use an external provider for Mental Health Transport services? Yes

If not, are you planning on using them in the future? N/A

Q2. Mental Health Transport Spend .

2018/19 2019/20 2020/21 2021/22 2022/23 2023/24

Internal External Internal External Internal External Internal External Internal External Internal External

Annual Spend on Mental Health Transport [£]

Total Number of Journeys N/A Not recorded N/A 1,020 N/A Not recorded N/A 1,254 N/A 1,720 N/A 1,498

Q3. Current Mental Health Transport Provider Details

Current

Name of current Mental Health Transport provider(s) Secure Care UK, Prometheus

Total Contract Value [£] £1,300,700,000

Contact Start Date 01.05.24 

Contract End Date 31.03.25

Q4. Previous Mental Health Transport Provider Details

Previous

Name of the previous Mental Health Transport provider(s) SCUK, Prometheus

Reason for change capable of delivering service within parameters

FOI 0201_2024 Response

The Trust is unable to provide a response. This is because the requested information pertains to granular details, that if released in conjunction with the overall contract value and number of journeys will place our current providers and future bidders at a disadvantage.  The Trust therefore rely on exemption Section 43 to deny this query. 


